COUNTY OF ROCKLAND

Department of General Services
Purchasing Division

Contract Award Notification

Title: FUEL, UNLEADED
Contract Period: February 14, 2025 thru January 9, 2027
Original Date of Issue: ~ February 3, 2025
Date of Revision:
S/C No: S/C PC70569
Catalog: Automobiles & Vehicles
Authorized Users: Rockland
Address Inquires To:
Robert Poole
Purchaser I
845-364-3808

845-364-3809
pooler@co.rockland.ny.us

Description
This contract is for Unleaded Fuel.

Contract # Vendor Number Contractor & Address Telephone No.
S/C PC70569 0000018745 Global Montello Group Corp. 781-398-4003
800 South Street
Waltham, MA 02454 Dispatch number:
Contact: Kevin Young 800-826-5686
smartbuydispatch@globalp.com

Fax: 781-398-9213
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Dept. of General Services
Purchasing Division

50 Sanatorium Rd

Bldg A, 6th FI, Room 609

POMONA NY 10970
www.rcpurchasing.com

Supplier 0000018745
Global Montello Group
800 South Street
Waltham MA 02454

Phone  800/542-0778
Fax 781/398-9213

County of Rockland

CONTRACT

bids@globalp.com, smartbuydispatch@

Dispatch via Print

Contract ID Page
S/C PC70569 lof 1
Contract Dates Currency
02/14/2025 to 01/09/2027 usb
Contract Maximum

Fuel gasoline 510,844.35
Freight Terms Buyer Email

pooler@co.rockland.ny.us
Buyer Phone Fax

Poole,Robert 845/364-3808 845/364-3809

Tax Exenpt ? Tax Exenpt |D:

Line# Supplier Item Item Desc Item ID Price UoM
1 GASOLINE - REGULAR UNLEADED 40515000001 1.00000 Dollar
2 GASOLINE - PREMIUM UNLEADED 40515000002 1.00000 Dollar
3 GASOLINE-Federal Hazardous Superfund Tax 40515000003 1.00000 Dollar

PRICES, TERMS AND CONDITIONS ARE IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE CONTRACT S/C PC70569 AWARD 23344

Authorized Signature

”Pdal%uww




Newe | Office of General Services
STATE | Procurement Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Contract Award Notification

Title . Group 05600 — Gasoline & E-85 (Statewide)
) Classification Code(s): 15
Award Number 1 23344 (Replaces Award 23237)
Contract Period :  February 14, 2025 — January 9, 2027
Bid Opening Date :  November 14, 2024
Date of Issue : January 10, 2025

Specification Reference : As Incorporated herein

Contractor Information : Appears on Page 2 of this Award

Address Inquiries To:

State Agencies & Vendors Political Subdivisions & Others
Procurement Services
Name @ Tqoqq Kayser Customer Services
Title ' Contract Management Specialist 2
Phone : 518-473-3252 Phone : 518-474-6717
E-mail : Todd.kayser@ogs.ny.gov E-mail : customer.services@ogs.ny.gov

Procurement Services values your input.
Complete and return "Contract Performance Report" at end of document.

Description
The purpose of this Award is to provide Authorized Users with a means of acquiring various grades of
Gasoline and E-85 by bulk delivery to an Authorized User’s storage facility for use in the Authorized User’s
own pumps. The product shall be Contractor furnished, delivered and unloaded as specified herein. For
current contract prices, please go to the Pricing Information link on the Award page.

This Award has 0% MBE, 0% WBE and 0% SDVOB goal requirements.

PR # 23344

0560023344a
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NOTE: See individual contract items to determine actual awardees.

FEIN /
Contractor & Address Contact Information NYS Vendor
ID

Contract
Number

PC70568 | Buell Fuel, LLC Julia Brouillette 760826999
SB 2676 State Route 12B Contracts Manager 1000009690
Deansboro, NY 13328 Phone: 315-841-3000
Email: Julia@buellfuel.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:

M — F 7:30am — 4:30pm, Sat 8am — 12pm
Customer Service Representative

Phone: 315-841-3000

Email: info@buellfuel.com

Person to Contact to Escalate Contract
Orders:

AJ Buell

Lead Dispatcher

Phone: 315-841-3000

Email: Ad@buellfuel.com

Contact for After Hours, Weekend/Holidays,
or NYS Declared Emergency:

Garth Curtis

Director of Bids & Supply

Phone: 315-841-3000

Cell: 315-404-3899

Email: Garth@buellfuel.com

Backup Contact for NYS Declared
Emergencies or Disasters (available
throughout emergency):

Michael Buell

Owner

Phone: 315-841-3000

Cell: 315-941-9716

Email: MB@buellfuel.com

PC70569 | Global Montello Group Corp. Bid Department 043443028
8000 South Street Bid Personnel 1100005467
Waltham, MA 02454 Phone: 781-398-4003
Email: bids@globalp.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:
24/7/365

Dispatch Department

Dispatch Personnel

Toll-Free: 800-826-5686

Email: smartbuydispatch@globalp.com

Contact for After Hours, Weekend/Holidays,
or NYS Declared Emergency:
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Dispatch Department
Toll-Free: 800-826-5686
Email: smartbuydispatch@globalp.com

Backup Contact for NYS Declared
Emergencies or Disasters (available
throughout emergency):

Mark Romaine

Chief Operating Officer

Phone: 781-398-4003

Email: MRomaine@globalp.com

PC70570 | Goetz Energy Corp. dba Kurk
Fuel Company
1319 Military Road

Buffalo, NY 14217

Mary Burke

Fuels Account Manager
Phone: 716-824-1298

Email: MBurke@kurkfuel.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:

M-F 8am-5pm

Mary Burke

Fuels Account Manager

Phone: 716-824-1298

Email: MBurke@kurkfuel.com

Contact for After Hours, Weekend/Holidays,
or NYS Declared Emergency:

Mary Burke

Fuels Account Manager

Phone: 716-824-1298

Cell: 716-867-9547

Email: MBurke@kurkfuel.com

Backup Contact for NYS Declared
Emergencies or Disasters (available
throughout emergency):

Mike Asher

Dispatch

Phone: 716-876-4324

Cell: 716-480-3316

Email: customerservice@goetzenergy.com

160450990
1000007438

PC70571 | Mirabito Holdings, Inc. dba
Mirabito Energy Products
The Metrocenter

49 Court Street

P.O. Box 5306

Binghamton, NY 13902

Joe D’Esti

Pricing and Bid Administrator
Phone: 607-352-2958
Toll-Free: 800-934-9480

Email: Joe.Desti@mirabito.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:

M —F 8:00am — 5:00pm

Paul Gunther

Customer Service Manager

Phone: 607-352-2830

Toll-Free: 800-934-9480

Email: Paul.Gunther@mirabito.com

150552668
1000007358
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Kings OPRG(E) Premium $2.9397 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Lewis Gasoline Regular $2.7550 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Livingston Gasoline Regular $2.6425 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Livingston Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.9725 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Madison Gasoline Regular $2.6250 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Madison Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.8825 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Monroe Flex Fuel (E-85) No bid N/A No bid
Monroe Gasoline Regular $2.6050 $0.0000 NOCO Energy
Monroe Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.8620 $0.0000 NOCO Energy
Monroe Gasoline Premium $3.1995 $0.0000 NOCO Energy
Montgomery | Gasoline Regular $2.5700 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Nassau OPRG(E) Regular $2.5192 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Nassau OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.6452 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Nassau OPRG(E) Premium $2.7714 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
New York OPRG(E) Regular $3.1215 $0.0000 Global Montello
New York OPRG(E) Premium $3.3820 $0.0000 Global Montello
Niagara Gasoline Regular $2.6050 $0.0125 NOCO Energy
Niagara Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.9450 $0.0125 NOCO Energy
Niagara Gasoline Premium $3.2825 $0.0125 NOCO Energy
Oneida Gasoline Regular $2.5535 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Oneida Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.5535 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Onondaga Gasoline Regular $2.5125 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Ontario Gasoline Regular $2.7350 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Ontario Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.9710 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Ontario Gasoline Premium $3.3150 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Orange Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.6692 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orange OPRG(E) Regular $2.7563 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orange OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.8232 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orange OPRG(E) Premium $3.0197 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orleans Flex Fuel (E-85) No bid N/A No bid
Orleans Gasoline Regular $2.5924 $0.0000 NOCO Energy
Orleans Gasoline Premium $3.2199 $0.0000 NOCO Energy
Oswego Flex Fuel (E-85) No bid N/A No bid
Oswego Gasoline Regular $2.6975 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Otsego Gasoline Regular $2.6700 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Putnam OPRG(E) Regular $2.7315 $0.0000 Global Montello
Putnam OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.7983 $0.0000 Global Montello
Putnam OPRG(E) Premium $2.9949 $0.0000 Global Montello
Queens OPRG(E) Regular $2.6275 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Queens OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.7536 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Queens OPRG(E) Premium $2.8798 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Rensselaer | Gasoline Regular $2.6307 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Rensselaer | Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.8252 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Richmond OPRG(E) Regular $3.1215 $0.0000 Global Montello
Rockland OPRG(E) Regular $2.7686 $0.0000 Global Montello
0560023344a (continued)
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Rockland OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.8354 $0.0000 Global Montello
Rockland OPRG(E) Premium $3.0319 $0.0000 Global Montello
Saratoga Gasoline Regular $2.6525 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Saratoga Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.8835 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Saratoga Gasoline Premium $3.2550 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Schenectady | Gasoline Regular $2.6405 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Schenectady | Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.8750 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Schoharie Gasoline Regular $2.6573 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Schuyler Gasoline Regular $2.8520 $0.0000 NOCO Energy
Seneca Flex Fuel (E-85) No bid N/A No bid
Seneca Gasoline Regular $2.7070 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Seneca Gasoline Mid-Grade $3.0325 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Seneca Gasoline Premium $3.4200 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
St Lawrence | Flex Fuel (E-85) No bid N/A No bid
St Lawrence | Gasoline Regular $2.8550 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
St Lawrence | Gasoline Mid-Grade $3.1310 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Steuben Gasoline Regular $2.8350 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Steuben Gasoline Mid-Grade $3.0810 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Suffolk OPRG(E) Regular $2.5161 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Suffolk OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.6421 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Suffolk OPRG(E) Premium $2.7683 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Sullivan Gasoline Regular $2.7092 $0.0000 Global Montello
Sullivan Gasoline Premium $3.1930 $0.0000 Global Montello
Tioga Gasoline Regular $2.8200 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Tompkins Gasoline Regular $2.6645 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Ulster Gasoline Regular $2.6905 $0.0000 Global Montello
Ulster Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.8699 $0.0000 Global Montello
Ulster Gasoline Premium $3.1243 $0.0000 Global Montello
Warren Gasoline Regular $2.6625 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Warren Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.9525 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Washington | Gasoline Regular $2.6865 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Washington | Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.9425 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Washington | Gasoline Premium $3.4675 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Wayne Gasoline Regular $2.6990 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Wayne Gasoline Mid-Grade $2.9810 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Westchester | OPRG(E) Regular $2.6143 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Westchester | OPRG(E) Mid-Grade $2.7403 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Westchester | OPRG(E) Premium $2.8665 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Wyoming Gasoline Regular $2.7145 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Yates Gasoline Regular $2.8350 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
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